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The book is devoted to the properties of conics (plane curves of second degree) that can be formulated and
proved using only elementary geometry. Starting with the well-known optical properties of conics, the
authors move to less trivial results, both classical and contemporary. In particular, the chapter on projective
properties of conics contains a detailed analysis of the polar correspondence, pencils of conics, and the
Poncelet theorem. In the chapter on metric properties of conics the authors discuss, in particular, inscribed
conics, normals to conics, and the Poncelet theorem for confocal ellipses. The book demonstrates the
advantage of purely geometric methods of studying conics. It contains over 50 exercises and problems aimed
at advancing geometric intuition of the reader. The book also contains more than 100 carefully prepared
figures, which will help the reader to better understand the material presented
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From reader reviews:

Jimmy Stansberry:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also get a life style. This reading addiction give you lot of
advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book
this improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of publication
you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want really feel happy
read one along with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Often the Geometry of Conics
(Mathematical World) is kind of book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

David Smith:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This publication Geometry of Conics (Mathematical World) was filled concerning
science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has
distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can truly
feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you simply
wanted.

Calvin Lee:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This particular book Geometry of Conics (Mathematical World) was
multi-colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Geometry of Conics (Mathematical
World) has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigator
Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you
bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like
reading that will.

Erik Garcia:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It
is referred to as of book Geometry of Conics (Mathematical World). You can include your knowledge by it.
Without causing the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make an individual happier to
read. It is most essential that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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