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The personal testimony of a minister ordained in the Ohio-based Churches of Christ in Christian Union
PREFACE: This little book relates the story of the life of Billy R. Reavis, his conversion and his call to
God's work. He gives testimony to his personal pentecost and God's leading in his life. The author deals with
the subject of sin -- what it is and how God's Word warns against it. Personally, I feel the printing of this
testimony will prove a blessing to many. --W. L. Cozad, General Superintendent, Churches of Christ in
Christian Union DEDICATION: I count it a privilege and a blessing to know the author of this little book,
and it was my privilege to introduce him to the "Churches of Christ in Christian Union." My first impression
when I met Rev. Billy R. Reavis, was truly he is called of God, and there are few like him. After reading this
book, I'm sure you will say the same. --Rev. Agnes Poklaheln, Pastor of "The Miracle Church," Wapakonita,
Ohio
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Hawkins:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that guide
has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are
reading whatever they get because their hobby will be reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book once they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you will need this My Testimony.

Carl Guerra:

The book My Testimony can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So just why
must we leave the great thing like a book My Testimony? Some of you have a different opinion about e-
book. But one aim that book can give many data for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer along
with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could
share all of these. Book My Testimony has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function
for you. You can appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a publication. So it is very
wonderful.

Willa Killeen:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As it is known to us that
book is very important for people. The book My Testimony seemed to be making you to know about other
information and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The reserve My
Testimony is not only giving you far more new information but also to become your friend when you feel
bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship with the
book My Testimony. You never feel lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Paul Jackson:

Do you among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
that aren't like that. This My Testimony book is readable through you who hate those perfect word style. You
will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving perhaps decrease the
knowledge that want to give to you. The writer involving My Testimony content conveys the idea easily to
understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different as
it. So , do you even now thinking My Testimony is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?
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